
accordance with its stated purpose of providing services to such individuals
and not for the benefit of other persons, organizations, or associations. The
costs of compiling, copying, and mailing the list shall be paid by such entity.

(4) Within fourteen days after receiving from the director of job and
family services a list of the names and social security numbers of recipients
of public assistance pursuant to section 5101.181 of the Revised Code, the
board shall inform the auditor of state of the name, current or most recent
employer address, and social security number of each member whose name
and social security number are the same as those of a person whose name or
social security number was submitted by the director. The board and its
employees, except for purposes of furnishing the auditor of state with
information required by this section, shall preserve the confidentiality of
recipients of public assistance in compliance with division (A) of section
5101.181 of the Revised Code.

(5) The system shall comply with orders issued under section 3105.87
of the Revised Code.

On the written request of an alternate payee, as defined in section
3105.80 of the Revised Code, the system shall furnish to the alternate payee
information on the amount and status of any amounts payable to the
alternate payee under an order issued under section 3105.171 or 3105.65 of
the Revised Code.

(6) At the request of any person, the board shall make available to the
person copies of all documents, including resumes, in the board's possession
regarding filling a vacancy of an employee member or retirant member of
the board. The person who made the request shall pay the cost of compiling,
copying, and mailing the documents. The information described in this
division is a public record.

(7) The system shall provide the notice required by section 5505.263 of
the Revised Code to the prosecutor assigned to the case.

(F) A statement that contains information obtained from the system's
records that is certified and signed by an officer of the retirement system and
to which the system's official seal is affixed, or copies of the system's
records to which the signature and seal are attached, shall be received as true
copies of the system's records in any court or before any officer of this state.

Sec. 5505.22. The right of any individual to a pension, or to the return
of accumulated contributions, payable as provided under this chapter, and
all moneys and investments of the state highway patrol retirement system
and income from moneys or investments are exempt from any state tax,
except the tax imposed by section 5747.02 of the Revised Code, and are
exempt from any county, municipal, or other local tax, except income taxes
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imposed pursuant to section 5748.02 or, 5748.08, or 5748.09 of the Revised
Code, and, except as provided in sections 3105.171, 3105.65, 3115.32,
3119.80, 3119.81, 3121.02, 3121.03, 3123.06, 5505.26, 5505.262, and
5505.263 of the Revised Code, shall not be subject to execution,
garnishment, attachment, the operation of bankruptcy or insolvency laws, or
any other process of law whatsoever, and shall be unassignable except as
specifically provided in this chapter.

Sec. 5525.04. No bidder shall be given a certificate of qualification
unless the bidder's financial statement and the investigation made by the
director of transportation show that the bidder possesses net current assets or
working capital sufficient, in the judgment of the director, to render it
probable that the bidder can satisfactorily execute the bidder's contracts and
meet all contractual obligations. Any applicant desiring a certificate of
qualification in an amount of two five million dollars or more shall submit
on forms prescribed by the director a financial audit prepared and attested as
correct by an independent certified public accountant. Any applicant
desiring a certificate of qualification in an amount that is less than two five
million dollars shall submit a financial review on forms prescribed by the
director. The aggregate amount of work set forth in either type of certificate
of qualification shall not exceed ten times the applicant's net current assets
or working capital. At the time of bidding, a bidder's qualification is
determined by the bidder's qualification amount minus all of the bidder's
pending work.

Applicants for qualification shall expressly authorize the director to
obtain any information that the director considers pertinent, with respect to
the financial worth, assets, and liabilities of the applicant, from banks or
other financial institutions, surety companies, dealers in material,
equipment, or supplies, or other persons having business transactions with
the applicant. Applicants shall expressly authorize all such financial
institutions or other persons to furnish any such information requested from
them by the director. All information filed with or furnished to the director
by applicants or other persons, in connection with the administration of
sections 5525.02 to 5525.09 of the Revised Code, shall be kept in
confidence by the director and not revealed to any person, except upon
proper order of a court. Failure to submit the required information or to
expressly grant the director authority to obtain the required information shall
result in the denial of a certificate of qualification. The director or the
director's subordinates shall have access to the books of account and
financial records of all applicants, unless the financial statement furnished
by any applicant is prepared and attested as correct by a certified public
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