
be recovered in accordance with section 145.563, 742.64, 3305.22, 3307.47,
3309.70, or 5505.34 of the Revised Code.

(D) For purposes of this section, a violation of section 2923.32 of the
Revised Code or any other violation or offense that includes as an element a
course of conduct or the occurrence of multiple acts is "committed on or
after the effective date of this section" if the course of conduct continues,
one or more of the multiple acts occurs, or the offender's accountability for
the course of conduct or for one or more of the multiple acts continues on or
after the effective date of this section.

Sec. 3305.07. (A) Neither the state nor a public institution of higher
education shall be a party to any contract purchased in whole or in part with
contributions to an alternative retirement plan made under section 3305.06
of the Revised Code. No retirement, death, or other benefits shall be payable
by the state or by any public institution of higher education under any
alternative retirement plan elected pursuant to this chapter.

(B)(1) Except as provided under division (B)(2) of this section and
sections 3305.08, 3305.09, and 3305.11, and 3305.12 of the Revised Code,
benefits shall be paid to an electing employee or the employee's
beneficiaries in accordance with the alternative retirement plan adopted by
the public institution of higher education at which the employee is
employed.

(2) A benefit or payment shall not be paid under an investment option
prior to the time an electing employee dies, terminates employment with the
public institution of higher education, or, if provided under the alternative
retirement plan or investment option, becomes disabled, except that the
provider of the investment option shall transfer the employee's account
balance to another provider as provided under section 3305.053 of the
Revised Code.

Sec. 3305.08. Any payment, benefit, or other right accruing to any
electing employee under a contract entered into for purposes of an
alternative retirement plan and all moneys, investments, and income of those
contracts are exempt from any state tax, except the tax imposed by section
5747.02 of the Revised Code, are exempt from any county, municipal, or
other local tax, except taxes imposed pursuant to section 5748.02 or 5748.08
of the Revised Code, and except as provided in sections 3105.171, 3105.65,
3115.32, 3119.80, 3119.81, 3121.02, 3121.03, 3123.06, and 3305.09, and
3305.12 of the Revised Code, shall not be subject to execution, garnishment,
attachment, the operation of bankruptcy or the insolvency law, or other
process of law, and shall be unassignable except as specifically provided in
this section and sections 3105.171, 3105.65, 3119.80, 3119.81, 3121.02,
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